



COPY

Commissioners Court

NOV 13 2017

REQUEST FOR AGENDA PLACEMENT FORM

Submission Deadline - Tuesday, 12:00 PM before Court Dates

Approved

SUBMITTED BY: Ralph McBroom
TODAY'S DATE: November 3, 2017

DEPARTMENT: Purchasing

DEPARTMENT HEAD: Ralph McBroom

REQUESTED AGENDA DATE: November 13, 2017

SPECIFIC AGENDA WORDING: Consider and award RFB 2018-801 Asphalt and Asphalt Emulsions to Ergon Asphalt, Rooker Asphalt, Crafcot Texas Inc., Cleveland Asphalt, P2 Emulsions, and Gem Seal.

PERSON(S) TO PRESENT ITEM: Ralph McBroom C.P.M.

SUPPORT MATERIAL: (See attached)

TIME: 5 min	ACTION ITEM: X
(Anticipated number of minutes needed to discuss item)	WORKSHOP
	CONSENT:
	EXECUTIVE:

STAFF NOTICE:

COUNTY ATTORNEY:
AUDITOR:
PERSONNEL:
BUDGET COORDINATOR:

IT DEPARTMENT:
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT:
PUBLIC WORKS:
OTHER:

*****This Section to be completed by County Judge's Office*****

ASSIGNED AGENDA DATE: _____

REQUEST RECEIVED BY COUNTY JUDGE'S OFFICE _____

COURT MEMBER APPROVAL _____ Date _____

RFB 2018-801: Asphalt and Asphalt Emulsions (REBID)

Vendor:	Ergon Asphalt		Rooker Asphalt		Crafco Texas Inc.		Cleveland Asphalt		P2 Emulsion		Gem Seal	
	Pick up	Freight	Pick Up	Freight	Pick Up	Delivered	Pick up	Delivered	Pick Up	Delivered	Pick Up	Delivered
CRS-2	\$1.45	\$0.1223	\$1.35	\$0.11	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.30	\$1.52	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
CRS-2H	\$1.45	\$0.1223	\$1.35	\$0.11	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.30	\$1.52	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
MS-2	\$2.15	\$0.1885	\$2.05	\$0.11	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.40	\$1.62	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
HFRS-2	\$2.15	\$0.1885	\$2.05	\$0.11	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
RC-250	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.60	\$2.82	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
AC-5	\$1.95	\$0.1223	\$1.85	\$0.11	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.93	\$2.15	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
AC-10	\$1.90	\$0.1223	\$1.80	\$0.11	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.93	\$2.15	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
AC-15P 3% Polymer	\$2.40	\$0.1223	\$2.30	\$0.11	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.38	\$2.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
AC-15XP 2% Polymer	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.38	\$2.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
MC-30	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.30	\$0.35	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.70	\$2.92	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
CRS-1P	\$2.45	\$0.3210	\$2.35	\$0.38	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
P2 Prime	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.20	\$1.45	NO BID	NO BID
P2 Prime Emulsifies Concentrate	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.30	\$1.52	\$1.99	\$2.24	NO BID	NO BID
Diluted AEP 40% H2O 60% Product	\$1.67	\$0.1223	\$1.57	\$0.11	NO BID	\$1.30	\$1.21	\$1.43	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
50% H2O 50% Product	\$1.46	\$0.1223	\$1.36	\$0.11	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.03	\$1.25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
60% H2O 40% Product	\$1.24	\$0.1223	\$1.14	\$0.11	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.84	\$1.06	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
CWE/CWP2 Emulsified Asphalt	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.30	\$1.52	\$2.74	\$2.99	NO BID	NO BID
Hot Pour Liquid Crack Sealer	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.40	\$0.42	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.445	\$0.46
Rate of Demurrage Per Hour	First two hours free, \$80/hr after		First two hours free, \$90/hr after				First two hours free, \$80/hr after		First two hours free, \$80.00/hr after			
Minimum Order, if Applicable	5,500 gallons		5,500 gallons				5,000		5,000 gallons			
Other Fees	Pump & Hose \$90/load, return is 1/2 the outgoing tariff		Pump charge: \$200.00				Diluted materials cannot be returned for credit		Push charge: \$80.00/hr, \$1,500.00 return load			